
“So, uh, what are you up to, honey?” 
 
Finally home from a long day at work, Claire began taking off her leather jacket as she watched 
Sherry pose herself in the bathroom mirror, the young blonde making sure that her huge tits, 
ass, and most importantly, dick, were on full display.  
 
“Oh, hey. Just getting us some entertainment for tonight.” Sherry said without looking at Claire 
as she continued posing for her selfie, trying to find just the right angle to highlight all of her 
assets. “I just had a great idea and I wanted to try it out.” 
 
“Well, alright then, good luck with.... whatever it is that you’re doing. Once I’m done getting 
undressed I’ll be in the shower so just gimme a call if you need me.” Claire responded as she 
finally got herself out of her jacket. 
 
Continuing to undress, the older woman began unbuckling her belt, immediately gaining 
Sherry’s full attention below her waist. With a soft click as the buckle came loose, the brunette 
now began the arduous process of pulling down her pants. The main issue with this was the 
woman’s absurdly fat cock, that was visibly bulging through her jeans, as not only did it travel all 
the way down to her knee but the combination of her insane thickness and huge balls made the 
fit of her pants a bit.... snug.  
 
As she began pulling down her jeans, Claire groaned at the feeling of the fabric straining to pull 
itself over her dick and balls as the world-class cock hidden beneath began to show itself. 
Slowly but surely, the log of a penis began to become more exposed as Claire slid her jeans 
down, revealing more and more of it’s rugged size and bulbous veins along the way.  
 
Finally, Claire got down to the head of her cock, however, she came to another hitch as the lip 
of her pants had gotten caught on her large glans. Giving her jeans a few more light pulls, Claire 
finally steeled herself and gave them a rough tug downwards. 
 
Sherry watched in aroused fascination, as Claire’s penis was finally sprung free with a low moan 
from the older woman, bouncing slightly before coming to rest, the flaccid member hanging 
imposingly off of her crotch. However, it seemed Claire’s dick hadn’t been the only thing that 
had been released, as for some reason there was now a steaming pile of amazingly thick 
semen currently splattered onto the floor just beneath the older woman.  
 
“Uh, Claire?” Sherry motioned down to the goopy pile on the ground.  
 
Looking down, Claire’s eyes opened ever slightly wider in surprise before she rolled them 
exasperatedly.  
 



“Damn, looks like that new girl at work didn’t do a good enough job sucking the rest out.” Claire 
said with a frown as another helping of semen slowly fell out of her dick’s mouth. “And we just 
got the floors done. Looks like I’ll have to give the girl some extra training tomorrow.” 

The main reason this leakage had happened was due to the oversized girth of Claire’s cock. 
Almost everything involving the older woman’s penis was overly thick, from it’s girth, to her 
semen, and most notable in this case, her urethra. Because of her incredibly thick cum and the 
amount she produced, Claire’s dick had adapted to having a much wider urethra than normal to 
allow for easier flow. However, this created a secondary problem in which after she ejaculated, 
there would often be a large amount of semen left in her length. The cum would usually remain 
there while she was hard, but once her member went flaccid again it would begin to leak out, 
which could lead to quite a mess.  

To remedy this, every time Claire ejaculated, she had whatever partner she was with suck the 
remaining seed out of her cock. This was more difficult a task than one would first think, 
however, and if not done properly there would still be some spunk left inside, leading to the 
current situation.  

“Oh, don’t be too hard on her, it took me a while before I learned the right way to give you head 
too. Here, I’ll lick that up when I’m done so you go ahead and get in the shower.” Sherry said 
offhand as she went back to posing, satisfied at the eyeful she had gotten of Claire’s erotic 
body. “And besides, it’s not like we’ll be here too much longer anyway. We can just hire 
someone to do a floor cleaning after we leave.” 

The apartment that Claire and Sherry were currently staying in was one of the “family homes” 
that Ada and Claire had purchased when Sherry was young. These homes were intended for all 
of them to use and stay at so that they could remain in close proximity to one another, however, 
due to all of their jobs often taking them to different places in the world, they had dozens of 
these spread out across the globe for ease of access.  

“Well.... Alright, I suppose not everyone can be as talented at giving head as you. Then, I’m 
heading in.” Now standing completely bare with her curvy body on full display, Claire shot her 
surrogate "daughter" a puzzled look once again as the girl continued posing, before the brunette 
began walking towards the other unused bathroom.  

“Oh, before you get in, do you know if "mother" is gonna be home tonight?” Sherry questioned 
as she looked over at Claire again, feeling a slight arousal bloom in her belly at the sight of 
Claire’s huge bare tits and massive cock bouncing enticingly as the woman walked across the 
room.  

“Hm? Probably not.” There were only two women that Sherry Birkin considered her “mothers”, 
one of whom being Claire herself, and the other being Ada Wong. So when one of her 
“mothers” was already present, it was obvious who she was referring to just by process of 
elimination. 



“She said she had to go fuck some information out of a bio-weapons dealer in Korea or 
something like that, she probably won’t be home for a few more days.”  

“Hmm.... Ok then, if Ada’s not coming then it looks like I’ll only need about 20 or so....” Sherry 
mumbled to herself as she went back to posing. 

Claire gave Sherry one last confused look before she shrugged her shoulders and disappeared 
into the bathroom, the sounds of running water beginning soon after.  

Soon after, as Sherry kept posing she finally found an orientation she felt was perfect. Her huge 
tits, ass, and thighs were on full display, while her giant cock was held down by her free hand. 
Smiling at her work, Sherry snapped a few pictures, the flash of her camera blinking rapidly all 
the way, before she sauntered over towards the couch.  

As she walked, she spotted the pool of cum Claire had left behind and smiled. Going onto her 
knees, Sherry brought her face close to the still piping hot pile of semen and took a deep sniff. 
The scent coming off of the seed was so rich and thick that Sherry could almost taste it, and 
taste it she shall.  

Opening her mouth, Sherry closed her eyes and made a large ring with her lips before pressing 
it down onto the load of jelly like cum before applying some suction. Moaning as the overly thick 
spunk filled her mouth, Sherry kept drinking until her cheeks were bulging, gently rolling the still 
hot seed around in her mouth and letting out a low moan at the delicious taste of her "mother" 
before she began to swallow. The load was so thick that she could feel it sticking to her throat 
as it traveled down, and even after it was resting in her belly she could still taste and smell it’s 
poignant aroma coming from her orifice.  

Looking down, Sherry saw that there was still a large amount of the delicious liquid left, and 
happily began lapping up every last drop.  

‘Honestly, even after all these years I still can hardly believe how much she produces. Just from 
what was left in her dick there’s enough for 2 or 3 mouthfuls.’ 

Slurping down the final strand of cum, Sherry made sure that she had gotten every last morsel 
before standing up once again and beginning to move towards the couch, appreciating the 
warm pool of spunk that had formed within her belly.  

Resting her naked back on the couch, Sherry felt her smile grow wider as she opened her social 
media and began typing a post.  

>Hey all you girls out there, anyone interested in playing with me tonight? I promise this
little fella here is 100% real and ready for some action. I’m with my friend tonight (who,
btw, is packing a cock that even puts MINE to shame) and we’re feeling a little lonely, so



we decided we’d treat any of you sluts out there that are interested to the best pussy 
pounding of your lives! 

So if any of you dirty girls think you’ve got some huge tits and a nice, big, fuck-able ass, 
hit me up in the DM’s with a nice pic of your face and body! If we like you, we’ll send the 
address to meet us at.  

Oh, and just a heads up, we won’t be using any rubbers. ;) 

With that, Sherry added a few hashtags for the city their apartment was in as well as a few more 
lewd tags such as “Giant Cock” and “Huge tits” and, of course, an attachment of her recently 
taken selfie before hitting send. Sure, it was a little cheesy, but it would get the job done.  

Within less than a minute, she saw more than a dozen new pings in her direct messages and 
smiled. Looking through them, the blonde was happy to see a large list of photos containing 
young girls posed in as slutty of a way as they could. Unfortunately, all but one of them were 
pretty weak in both the tits and ass department. While none of them were “small” by any normal 
definition, Sherry had come to acquire a taste for only the most curvaceous girl’s she could find 
thanks to Ada and Claire.  

The one diamond in the rough however was a cute yet shy looking Indian girl with an incredibly 
large ass. The picture she had sent was clumsy at best, but her ass was so large that even with 
the amateur photography skills on display, it was easy to tell how curvaceous she actually was. 
Sending the apartment address and a message to “come as soon as you can” to the girl, Sherry 
moved to put her phone down and allow her DM’s to build.  

However, just as she was about to put her phone to sleep, she saw that there was a new 
comment under her post.  

>You’ve got a friend with a dong bigger than you!?!? There’s no way! That thing already
goes past your knees!

With a smirk, Sherry opened her camera app once more and rose from the couch, heading 
towards the bathroom.  

Opening the door, she was greeted with the sight of her completely naked "surrogate mother" 
just about to dip her feet into the running shower.  

“Hey, claire, show me your cock.” 

Once again Sherry watched as Claire gained a confused look on her face, but nevertheless the 
brunette immediately turned to the side and nonchalantly grabbed her insanely girthy cock with 
her right hand and lifted it up slightly in her palm.  



While Claire’s dick wasn’t much longer than Sherry’s, she was ridiculously girthy, not just more 
than Sherry, but possibly more so than anyone in the world.  But it wasn’t just her girth that put 
Sherry to shame, Claire’s balls also nearly dwarfed Sherry’s own, the massive cum tanks 
sagging almost halfway down her thighs.  

Snapping a quick picture of the Brunette holding her superior cock, Sherry threw a quick “thank 
you” to the woman before quickly exiting the bathroom, hearing mumbles of “weird daughter” as 
she closed the door behind her.  

As Sherry walked back to the couch she reopened her post, ignoring the nearly hundred new 
DM’s she had, and found the comment doubting her previous claim of Claire’s size.  

With a quick few taps, she responded to the comment with a message of; 

>Oh? Then what’s this I wonder? ;)

And added the recently taken picture of Claire. 

Almost instantly, multiple new comments were posted under her response as the post had 
already begun trending.  

>Holy shit! Look at that cockhead, I probably couldn’t even fit it in my mouth!

>Oh my god, I want to suckle those massive tits while she splits my pussy in half.... 

>Jesus.... Look at the size of those veins.... I bet she can get any girl she wants just by 
giving them a taste of that monster. 

Sherry watched with smug satisfaction as all the women that had been previously drooling over 
her giant cock began lusting after her “mother’s” instead. 

While most futa would probably find it odd that Sherry loved to brag so much about how 
someone had a bigger penis than her own, she had grown to find that exact situation incredibly 
sexy. Sherry found it hopelessly arousing to show off Ada and Claire’s world-class cocks to 
people.  

The way the two women had taught her about sex had led to Sherry having quite an odd 
personality in the bedroom. Whenever she was with normal women Sherry was quite dominant, 
though not nearly to the level of Claire or Ada. However, when she found herself in the 
presence of someone with a bigger cock than her, especially her two adoptive parents, she was 
more submissive than a newborn puppy.  



Feeling her huge cock begin to stiffen at the sight of all the praise, both for her own penis as 
well as Claire’s, Sherry quickly began to sort through her DM’s and began inviting only the 
curviest bitches she could find over.  
 
Just a few minutes later as she sent her 25th and final invitation to a cute little redhead girl with 
both a huge ass and an equally large pair of tits, she heard the apartment doorbell ring.  
 
Walking over to the door, Sherry opened it with a smile to see the Indian girl with the monstrous 
ass she had invited standing in the doorway, fidgeting nervously as she drank in Sherry’s naked 
form, her eyes becoming locked onto the pale girl’s huge cock once she saw it.  
 
The girl had light caramel skin and was a few inches taller than Sherry, though that wasn’t 
saying much as Sherry was quite short herself, topped off with a pair of simple blue jeans and a 
form fitting t-shirt, accentuating her modest bust and massive ass.  
 
“U-u-umm, h-hello, I’m here to uh.... h-here to-“ 
 
Sherry cut the girl off with a kiss, gently pulling the girl towards her as she placed her hands on 
the darker girl’s ass, enjoying the feeling of her fingers sinking into the soft flesh through her 
jeans.  
 
The Indian girl however remained completely frozen still as Sherry played with her lips.  
 
‘Huh.... No reaction.’ 
 
As Sherry continued suckling on the girl’s lips, the darker woman finally began moving as well, 
however her kisses were sloppy at best as she tried to capture Sherry’s lips.  
 
‘Wait, don’t tell me she’s a....” 
 
Gently breaking the kiss, but continuing her massage on the girl’s ass, Sherry looked at the 
heavily blushing girl in the eyes.  
 
“You’re a virgin, aren’t you?” 
 
The girl’s blush getting even deeper across her chestnut colored skin was all Sherry needed to 
know for her answer, but she let the girl speak anyway. 
 
“.....Y-yes. I’m sorry..... But, I just saw your dick and I.... I.... I’m sorry, I’m sure you want women 
with m-more experience.... I’ll just g-go back home.” The girl seemed on the verge of tears as 
she moved to turn back around.  
 
She was stopped however, by Sherry wrapping her in another warm kiss.  



 
“Nonsense.” Sherry said as she broke the kiss. “It makes me happy to know you’d want to have 
your first time with me. I’d be glad to fuck you!” Sherry said as she took the girl’s hand and 
began leading her into the apartment.  
 
“Oh! Thank you, uh, ma’am?” 
 
“Just ‘Sherry’ is fine. What’s your name?” The pale girl said with a giggle as she closed the door 
to the apartment.  
 
“O-oh! How rude of me, my name is Prisha. It’s an h-honor to meet you.” 
 
“It’s nice to meet you too, Prisha. There’s not too many girls out there with an ass as big as 
yours, so I always like to know more people as sexy as you.” Sherry said, giving one of the girl’s 
cheeks a light slap for emphasis, which led to the girl’s blush deepening further.  
 
“Oh, no! I’m just a w-weirdo introvert.... I h-honestly don’t even know how I worked up the 
courage to come here....”  
 
“Don’t sell yourself short, you’ve got a killer body and you’ve got to be pretty slutty too, since 
you were one of the first people to respond to my post. Lemme guess, you were browsing 
through the “Giant Cock” tag?” Sherry said to Prisha as the girl blushed even harder, confirming 
her answer. “Though, I won’t lie, it is a little weird that you’d want to have your first time at an 
orgy, but I suppose it’s as good a place as any, especially when you’ll be riding our cocks.” 
 
“Ah, y-y-yes.... You’re, really, um, huge.” 
 
“Hmm.... Still, you’re so adorable that I’ll feel bad if your first memory of fucking is surrounded by 
two dozen other girls.” Sherry said as she giggled at Prisha’s cute stutter. “Here, how about this, 
until the other girls get here I’ll give you a nice, slow, loving fuck for your first time?” 
 
“Oh!.... That, um, that sounds nice.” 
 
With a smile at the girl’s agreement, Sherry released her hand and ordered the girl to remove 
her clothes as they reached the couch.  
 
With her blush intensifying once again, Prisha nevertheless began disrobing at the girl’s 
command.  
 
Sherry watched the other woman like a hawk as she was finally able to drink in an unobstructed 
view of the girl’s ass. As she felt her already erect cock stiffen even further, she quickly 
approached Prisha as the darker skinned girl dropped the last of her undergarments on the 
ground and once again wrapped her in a warm kiss.  



 
As the kiss deepened, Prisha finally began moving as well, taking small, light movements unlike 
before. As they continued, Sherry slowly walked the two of them closer to the couch before 
gently pushing the girl down onto her back.  
 
“This position here is called missionary, it’s usually the best position for first timers to be most 
comfortable. Unfortunately, that means I won’t get to play too much with that ass of yours, but 
there’ll be time enough for that when I’m pounding you later.” Sherry said, her tone somehow 
sounding sweet and innocent despite her words. “It’s a good thing I messaged you earlier than 
all the others, we’ll have some time before the other sluts get here, and more importantly, before 
Claire gets out of the shower. She’s a lot less gentle than I am..... Now spread those legs of 
yours.” 
 
As the girl followed the instructions and laid further back on the cool leather, she gently spread 
her legs, exposing her unused pussy to the world.  
 
“Thank y-you for having me.” The girl stuttered out, her blush even deeper than before.  
 
“The pleasure’s all mine. Literally.” Sherry said with a joking smile before continuing. “Alright, 
time for a little crash course in how to take a massive cock!” 
 
With that, Sherry moved her penis into position so that the shaft was resting against Prisha’s 
lips before she began slowly rocking it up and down, coating her rod in the girl’s overflowing 
juices.  
 
“Man, you’re really wet! Looks like we won’t even need much foreplay.” Sherry commented, 
smiling gently as she watched the girl beneath her begin moaning.  
 
As she continued coating her dick, Sherry reached up and grabbed her own huge chest, 
beginning to lightly grope her tits as she stared down at the girl beneath her. Paying special 
attention to her areola and nipples, the blonde girl continued her self fondling before she felt a 
pleasurable warmth begin to spread through her breasts.  
 
Not long after, a droplet of white liquid escaped from out of the center of Sherry’s nipple. Soon 
after, one droplet became two, which became three, and as Sherry’s skillful hands continued on 
her massive tits, a small continuous outflow began coming from her nipples.  
 
“W-oah.... you l-lactate?” Prisha said between moans as she stared at Sherry’s huge breasts.  
 
“Yep. Some stuff happened to me when I was younger so now my body’s a bit.... different, than 
most people. Even by futa standards.” Sherry said as she grabbed her left tit and brought it to 
her mouth, taking a quick drink before releasing her nipple with a pop. “This is more for you 



though. See, my milk has some other benefits besides tasting good. The two most important in 
this case being that it enhances your pleasure centers and dulls your sense of pain.” 
 
Sherry then ceased grinding her cock against the girl’s entrance. Reaching down and stroking 
her dick, she made sure every possible spot was well lubricated in Prisha’s juices before she 
positioned the head at the girl’s entrance.  
 
“Ready, Prisha?” 
 
“Yes.” 
 
This time, she did not stutter. 
 
Feeling renewed lust at the determination in the girl’s eyes, Sherry moved down and gave the 
girl a loving kiss as she gently pushed the head of her cock into the girl’s core.  
 
Releasing the kiss, Sherry looked at the taller girl’s face as she breathed heavily, obviously 
struggling despite Sherry’s head only being inside.  
 
“It’s ok. Take your time to adjust.” The shorter girl said as she gently pat Prisha’s thighs.  
 
A few moments later when it seemed Prisha’s breathing had calmed some, Sherry began 
pushing her length in once again.  
 
The Indian girl began to moan loudly in a mix of pleasure and pain as the oversized cock began 
to form a bulge going up her stomach. With tears forming in her eyes, she bit down on her own 
lip to try and distract herself from the feeling of her hymen and unused pussy being torn and 
stretched so much.  
 
Finally Sherry stopped when the darker girl could no longer contain herself and let out a soft 
yelp of pain.  
 
“That’s a good girl, you almost took half of me in already! That’s amazing for your first time.” 
Sherry congratulated before leaning forward and offering one of her tits to the girl. “Here, drink. 
It’ll make you feel better, I promise.” 
 
As tears streamed down her face, Prisha didn’t hesitate to latch onto the hung futa’s nipple and 
begin suckling.  
 
Almost immediately, her previously tensed face began to relax as she drank from Sherry’s 
breast. As this continued, she began sucking more hungrily and even soon bringing her hands 
to the huge boob as well, trying to massage more milk out.  
 



“It’s alright, there’s no rush. You can drink as much as you want.” Sherry soothed as Prisha 
continued hungrily drinking from her breast. As this happened, Sherry began slowly rocking her 
cock in and out of the girl’s warm cunt, but being careful never to go further than halfway in, and 
though there were a few more soft mewls of pain at first, they soon faded as the girl continued 
ingesting her delicious milk.  
 
As this continued for a few more minutes, Sherry finally pulled her chest back, forcing Prisha to 
release her nipple with an audible pop.  
 
Looking at the woman’s face, Sherry was happy to find that all traces of pain were gone from 
her visage, instead replaced with the dilated pupils and heavy breathing that signified someone 
who was intoxicated on Sherry’s milk.  
 
“More....” The girl mewled as she tried to lean forward to get more of Sherry’s oversized boobs.  
 
“Ah, ah, you can keep drinking, or we can continue down here.” Sherry said as she ground her 
dick into the girl’s pussy a little harder, leading to Prisha to release a throaty moan. “And I 
promise you, you’ll like my dick milk a lot more.” 
 
As Prisha somewhat came back to her senses she nodded in understanding and spread her 
legs wider, excited for more of the meaty rod being pushed into her.  
 
“Good, nice and obedient. I like that in my girls.” Sherry praised. “Now, let’s go a little deeper.” 
 
Grabbing a hold of the girl’s meaty thighs, Sherry began pushing deeper into the taller girl than 
anytime previous. As she continued, she began hearing the lewd moans coming from the slut 
beneath her grow louder the deeper she got inside.  
 
‘Damn, this slut really was a good find. Not only is she nice and subservient, but her gigantic 
ass and this meaty pussy are both top class.’ Sherry thought as she groaned, feeling the girl’s 
pussy contract around her cock. ‘And I’m not even at her womb yet! Forget just a one night 
stand with her, I’m gonna have to keep this girl around.’ 
 
While most futa preferred “tight” pussies, people around Sherry’s size and above almost 
universally preferred deeper, meaty ones like Prisha’s. There was nothing worse than a girl’s 
cunt being too small and making you either have to go through great effort to force your dick in, 
or not be able to get it in at all.  
 
Thankfully, this was not a problem with the Prisha, as Sherry felt the familiar sensation of the 
head of her cock kissing the womb after nearly two thirds of her length was in.  
 
Continuing to push, Sherry finally felt herself bottom out inside of the girl, who’s womb was now 
visibly bulging out of her stomach along with Sherry’s penis.  



 
“Oh fuuuuccccckkkkkkkk!”  
 
With the final push forcing her over the edge, Sherry watched as the girl’s face contorted in 
pleasure, her eyes rolling back into her head as her pussy tightened around Sherry’s cock in a 
vice grip, the most powerful orgasm of Prisha’s life rocking through her body.  
 
Watching in amusement as the girl beneath her contorted and moaned through her orgasm, 
Sherry waited patiently for her to finish, enjoying the pleasurable contractions of the girl’s folds 
around her cock.  
 
Finally, after nearly a minute, Sherry watched as the girl’s eyes fluttered back into focus and 
looked at her in amazement.  
 
“T-that was amazing....” Prisha whispered. “I’ve never cum that hard in my life.... and it was just 
from you putting it in....” 
 
“Yep, and it’ll be even better when we start moving.” Sherry said, giving the girl a soft peck on 
the cheek. “Here, this time you can help me. Wrap your arms around my neck.” 
 
Prisha barely had time to comply before Sherry reached down and, in a remarkable display of 
strength, scooped the larger girl up as if she were as light as a feather. Acting on instinct, Prisha 
wrapped her legs around the blonde girl’s waist just in time for gravity to settle and Sherry’s dick 
was impaled even further into her. 
 
“There,” Sherry whispered into the girl’s ear as she began gently rocking back and forth, 
grinding into the taller girl. “Now we can both move.” 
 
However, Prisha hadn’t heard anything as another orgasm rocked her body, but nevertheless 
she began rocking her hips into tune with Sherry.  
 
“That’s a good girl.... oh, looks like someone’s at the door. It’ll be even more fun from here on, 
Prisha!” With that, Sherry gave the girl a firm slap on the ass and began walking to the door, her 
new slut moaning as she bounced on Sherry’s cock the entire way.  
 

 
 

 
 
As Claire washed out the last of the shampoo in her hair she reached out and grabbed a bottle 
of liquid body soap. Pouring a healthy portion onto her hand, the curvy woman began gently 
lathering up her body, feeling all the built up tension she had from her day be released as she 
cleaned away the sweat from the day off. After she had done a cursory cleaning of her entire 



body Claire once again poured a handful of liquid soap into her palms, this time however, she 
brought her hands up to her oversized tits and began to rub the cool liquid in. 
 
Claire smiled as she started her massage from the bottom of her breasts, feeling the heavy 
weight of her tits in her hand as she bounced them lightly before continuing to move her hands 
forward towards the nipple. She continued to repeat this motion for minutes as she moaned 
softly, almost losing track of time thanks to the pleasure stemming from her sensitive boobs. 
Moving her hands over her nipples, she then began to move her entire breast around in circular 
motions, causing her to moan ever so slightly louder than before.  
 
However, after a few minutes more she was soon forced to stop as she felt a warmth begin to 
bloom deep within her boobs. 
 
“Jeez, I barely start playing with them and I’m already about to let out milk.” Claire complained to 
herself as she moved her hands away from her massive chest. “I gotta stop letting it build up so 
much….” 
 
Usually Claire would have some of the girls at Terrasave or Sherry suck any excess milk out of 
her breasts when they built up too much, but lately she had gotten into a bad habit of getting a 
little too aroused during the process and almost always end up fucking whoever was servicing 
her breasts before they got the chance to finish. 
 
Putting it on the list for later, Claire moved on from her massive boobs down to her nearly 
equally large ass. Lightly slapping her hands down on both meaty cheeks, the brunette began 
deeply massaging the soap into her ass, moaning as the pleasant feeling flowed through them. 
While her butt wasn’t quite as sensitive as her tits, they definitely proved a nice alternative as 
she continued moving her large buttocks around.  
 
As her self pleasure continued, Claire felt the previous arousal from her tits and ass finally catch 
up to her as her oversized cock began to awaken. Claire watched lustfully as she continued 
playing with her ass and the massive slab of meat began to lengthen and thicken rapidly, with 
her many veins bulging to the surface. 
 
Once she was nearly half erect, Claire removed her right hand from the pleasant massage on 
her butt and began gently stroking the remaining liquid soap into her cock. Despite not even 
being near her full size, Claire couldn’t even fully encompass her shaft with her hand thanks to 
her massive girth, and soon was forced to release her other hand off of her ass cheeks where it 
joined in the stroking of the brunette’s steadily expanding cock. As Claire continued her 
self-stimulation, she attentively made sure she was getting all the exposed skin of her dick 
lathered in the soap, soon moving her right hand up to rotate her cockhead in her palm while 
her left hand began fondling her oversized balls.  
 



While Claire was obviously deriving her own pleasure from this, it was also an important step for 
futa her size when cleaning themselves, as the larger the cock the more buildup it collected 
throughout the day. Especially so when you got as much pussy as Claire did on a daily basis. 

However, as Claire continued her masturbation, long after what was needed for her to properly 
clean herself, she felt her balls beginning to expand in her hands, hungrily churning as they 
filled with her seed.  

“Damn, looks like that’s all for now.” Claire said with a sigh as she gave herself just a few more 
strokes before taking her hands off her genitals entirely, watching as her balls continued to 
expand for nearly a minute before finally stopping thanks to the lack of stimulation. While Claire 
usually didn’t care who or what she dirtied with her ejaculations, the bathroom had been 
deemed a “no-go” zone by both Sherry and Ada, as Claire’s release was so thick and 
voluminous that she would inevitably clog the drains with her cum if she relieved herself in the 
shower.  

“And now I need to let out a load soon to shrink these things back down.” Claire grumbled to 
herself. While she wouldn’t cum once her stimulation stopped,, her balls would remain at this 
enlarged size until she found release. 

Sighing, Claire began washing the soap off of her tits, ass, and dick, enjoying the pleasurable 
feeling of the water flowing over them, before turning down the knob and exiting the shower.  

After she dried off, Claire exited the bathroom with nothing but a towel thrown over her shoulder 
and her still fully erect cock leading the way. However, as she walked towards the living room 
slightly awkwardly, not accustomed to moving around when her testicles were so large, Claire 
was greeted to a sight she most certainly had not expected to see in the living room tonight.  

“Hey Claire! Look what I picked up!” 

There, standing in the center of the living room, was the girl she considered her "daughter" 
surrounded by what was easily more than twenty curvy and busty women, all completely naked, 
and trying their best to service Sherry.  

Sherry herself was currently standing in the middle of all of them, a dark skinned girl with a 
massive ass currently holding on for dear life as Sherry pounded her in the stand and carry 
position, an excessive amount of cum being forced out of the woman’s cunt with every thrust. 
Claire could already tell by the dark girl’s weak moans that she would soon be unconscious.  

“Sherry.... Is it my birthday and I just forgot? How the hell did you round all these sluts up so 
fast?” Claire questioned, however, without missing a beat she walked forward and grabbed the 



head of the nearest girl that had been drooling at the sight of her incredibly thick cock, slamming 
the already hard rod down the girl’s welcoming throat.  

“Well, I had a little idea today: What if I did a- oh fuck that’s tight..... a casting call online for any 
curvy sluts nearby that wanted to try out some huge dicks? A social media post and a few 
pictures later and here we are!” Sherry moaned out with a smile, feeling her arousal grow even 
further at the sight of her "adoptive mother" beginning to savagely face fuck the nearest woman 
to her.  

“Ah.... So that’s what the pictures were for..... Smart. Hey, you two sluts, on my balls. Now.” 
Claire said, the more experienced woman’s voice remained completely unchanged even as she 
ordered the next two near her to start sucking her enlarged balls as she face fucked the girl 
between her legs.  

“Yep! You’d be surprised how many girls nearby want some real cock, and how quickly they 
want it too. I already got a little head start on this slut right here.” Sherry said, slapping the 
Indian girl’s huge ass for emphasis, enjoying the way Prisha’s  huge meaty cheeks jiggled 
against her own huge balls. “I’m thinking we’ll each take about half of them, then we can switch 
off and fuck the other half?” 

With a wide smile on her face, Claire felt her balls once again begin to fill with cum as the two 
girls began fondling and sucking them, growing even larger than before. 

And with that, the two began a night of debauchery that would go down in history. 




